
COLORADO COUNTY BIDS FOR  
AC-5 ASPHALT, AC-10 ASPHALT, CRS-2 EMULSION, MC-30 ROAD OIL,  

AND SEAL COAT SEALERS 
OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 2, 2023  

FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2023 TO MARCH 31, 2024 
 
 
Bidder: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Precincts 

AC-5 Asphalt 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant 3.30 3.30 3.30 3.30 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area 3.49 3.49 3.49 3.49 
 
 
Bidder: Marten Asphalt Precincts 

AC-5 Asphalt 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant 2.40 2.40 2.40 2.40 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area 2.57 2.57 2.57 2.57 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Bidder: Ergon Asphalt Precincts 

AC-10 Asphalt 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant 3.25 3.25 3.25 3.25 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area 3.44 3.44 3.44 3.44 
 
 
Bidder: Marten Asphalt Precincts 

AC-10 Asphalt 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant 2.40 2.40 2.40 2.40 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area 2.57 2.57 2.57 2.57 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Bidder: Ergon Asphalt Precincts 
CRS-2 Emulsion 

with pump & hose 
One 

Rock Island 
Two 

Weimar 
Three 

Frelsburg 
Four 

Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant 2.80 2.80 2.80 2.80 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area 3.03 3.03 3.03 3.03 
 
 
Bidder: Marten Asphalt Precincts 

CRS-2 Emulsion 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant 2.50 2.50 2.50 2.50 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area 2.67 2.67 2.67 2.67 
 
 
 
 
 
Bidder: Ergon Asphalt Precincts 

MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal  
 with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
 
 
Bidder: Marten Asphalt Precincts 

MC-30 Road Oil or Proven Equal 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant 3.75 3.75 3.75 3.75 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area 3.92 3.92 3.92 3.92 
 
 
 
Bidder: Ergon Asphalt Precincts 

Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
 
 
Bidder: Marten Asphalt Precincts 

Seal Coat Sealers or Proven Equal 
with pump & hose 

One 
Rock Island 

Two 
Weimar 

Three 
Frelsburg 

Four 
Eagle Lake 
 

Price per Gal. F.O.B. Plant NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
Price per Gal. F.O.B. Colorado County Area NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
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